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DEVELOPMENT OF A TRAINING COURSE "MARKETING
PSYCHOLOGY, ADVERTISING AND PR" FOR STUDENTS OF 

PSYCHOLOGY

Abstract. The article examines issues that arose during the development 
and teaching of the "Psychology of Marketing, Advertising and PR" training 
course for psychology students. The study concerns the training of students 
majoring in Psychology at the Lviv State University of Life Safety, who are 
studying this course as an elective discipline in the third year of their 
undergraduate studies. The search for publications on the topic of the study 
made it possible to note that the available publications contain a lot of
information on the selected topic, as well as other material necessary to ensure 
the teaching of this educational course; however, a number of topics are 
insufficiently covered, which necessitates the organization of additional 
research and research work. The difficulties that arose during the preparation 
for teaching this educational course, in accordance with the current 
requirements, were clarified. Work with the discovered material and the 
experience of mastering this subject indicate that its study at the appropriate 
level under the existing realities requires the development and implementation 
of an appropriate conceptual approach. This approach to the creation of a 
training course was formed during the preparation of the training program for
the discipline "Psychology of Marketing, Advertising and PR". This 
determined the peculiarities of both the selection of the necessary material and 
the further process of familiarizing students with the subjects and problems of 



the discipline. According to the material found to provide the course, as well 
as the formed concept for its teaching, the task of both minimization and 
optimization of the educational material necessary for studying this discipline 
arose. According to this, all the involved material was placed in a clear logical 
sequence, according to the criterion of relevance and demand of certain 
knowledge in the activities of practical psychologists. Regarding the 
development of the optimal approach to teaching this educational course at the 
appropriate level under the existing conditions, it is recognized that it is 
necessary to take into account the current laws. Considered difficulties that 
arise when arranging and teaching this course in accordance with current 
requirements; proposed possible ways and methods of overcoming the 
identified difficulties. Conclusions are drawn from the work carried out and 
further promising research in this direction is proposed.

Keywords: training of future professional psychologists, formation of 
professional competence, psychology of marketing, psychology of advertising, 
psychology of public relations, educational work with students.
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